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ESTATE & TRUST 

NOTICES 

 

FIRST PUBLICATION 
 

  ESTATE OF EDWIN J. 

SHELLENHAMER, late of Middletown 
Borough, Dauphin County, PA (died: August 

17, 2020)  

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Bart L. Shellenhamer 

  Attorney: James M. Zugay, Esquire, 1253 

Stonegate Road, Hummelstown, PA 17036 

n5-19 

     

 
  ESTATE OF KATHRYN E. 

HIMMELBERGER, late of Derry Township, 

Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executrix, Co-Executor or attorney, and 
all persons indebted to the decedent to make 

payment to the Co-Executrix, Co-Executor 

without delay. 

  Co-Executrix: Wendy Lyn Carfagno 

  Co-Executor: Kirk Lee Himmelberger 

  Attorney: Charles A. Ritchie, Jr., Esquire, 

Feather and Feather, P.C., 22 West Main Street, 

Annville, PA 17003                                    n5-19 
     

 

  ESTATE OF DELORIS E. MEEK, late of 

Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

   Executor: Troy Meek, c/o Craig A. Hatch, 

Esquire, Halbruner, Hatch & Guise, LLP, 2109 

Market Street, Camp Hill, PA 17011          n5-19 

     
 

  ESTATE OF MARY JEAN MONAHAN, 

late of Lower Paxton, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: 9/20/2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Robert M. Monahan, Jr.  

  Attorney: Patrick S. Cawley, Esq., Keystone 

Elder Law P.C., 555 Gettysburg Pike, Suite B-

200, Mechanicsburg, Pennsylvania, 17055 

n5-19 

     

 
  ESTATE OF CARMEN D. ZENON, late of 

Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administratrix without delay. 

  Administratrix: Denise Zenon, 1960 NE 48th 

Street, Apt. 2, Pompano Beach, FL 30064 

  Attorney:  Russell J. Bopp, Esquire, Marcus & 

Mack, P.C., 57 S. 6th Street, Indiana, PA  15701 

n5-19 

     
 

  ESTATE OF RICHARD N. FRANZ, SR., 

late of Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin 

County, PA (died: August 11, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Charme Nicole Karnash, c/o Hazen 

Law Group, 2000 Linglestown Road, Suite 202, 

Harrisburg, PA 17110 

  Attorney: Estate of Richard N. Franz, Sr., c/o 
Hazen Law Group, 2000 Linglestown Road, 

Suite 202, Harrisburg, PA 17110                n5-19 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JOHN H. KEGEL, late of 

Middle Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: August 27, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Darlene A Kegel, c/o Hazen Law 

Group, 2000 Linglestown Road, Suite 202, 
Harrisburg, PA 17110 

  Attorney: Estate of John H. Kegel, c/o Hazen 

Law Group, 2000 Linglestown Road, Suite 202, 

Harrisburg, PA 17110                                 n5-19 

     



 

  ESTATE OF EDWARD L. WEIST, late of 

Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor, Executrix or attorney, and all 

persons indebted to the decedent to make 

payment to the Executor or Executrix without 

delay. 

  Executor: Edward Weist, Jr., 5235 Miller 
Drive, Macungie, PA 18062 

  Executrix: Jennifer Schwartz, 18 Edgehill 

Road, Hershey, PA 17033 

  Attorney: Theresa L. Shade Wix. Esq., Wix, 

Wenger & Weidner, 4705 Duke Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17109-3041                        n5-19 

     

 
  ESTATE OF LYDIA R. LEIDICH, a/k/a 

LYDIA RUTH LEIDICH a/k/a RUTH 

LEIDICH, late of Swatara Township, Dauphin 

County, PA (died: May 5, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executors or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executors without delay. 

  Executors: Deborah I. Leidich, Karen A. 

Cordner, Lance S. Leidich and Kim S. Felker  

  Attorney: Diane S. Baker, P.O. Box 6443, 

Harrisburg, PA 17112-0443                        n5-19 
     

 

  ESTATE OF DAVID J. WILLIAMS, late of 

Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administratrix without delay. 

  Administratrix: Jill D’Amico 

  Attorney: Heather D. Royer, Esquire, 

Johnson, Duffie, Stewart & Weidner, P.C., 301 

Market Street, P.O. Box 109, Lemoyne, PA 
17043                                                          n5-19 

     

 

  ESTATE OF DAMON N. LOVELESS a/k/a 

DAMON LOVELESS, late of Lower Swatara 

Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Dennis A. Loveless, c/o Nikolaus & 

Hohenadel, LLP, 222 S. Market Street, Suite 

201, Elizabethtown, PA 17022 
  Attorney: Kevin D. Dolan, Esq.              n5-19 

     

 

  ESTATE OF PAUL S. ALLEN, late of 

Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: January 18, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Julia S. Allen, c/o Edward P. 

Seeber, Esquire, JSDC Law Offices, Suite C-

400, 555 Gettysburg Pike, Mechanicsburg, PA 
17055; 717-533-3280                                  n5-19 

     

 

  ESTATE OF MACKENZIE P. MULROY 

late of Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin 

County, PA (died: January 9, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Edward P. Seeber, Esquire, 

JSDC Law Offices, Suite C-400, 555 Gettysburg 
Pike, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055; 717-533-3280 

n5-19 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JANICE LYNN WELLS, late 

of Halifax Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: September 25, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Andrew K. Hoover, 265 
Ebenezer Road, Halifax, PA 17032 

  Attorney: Joseph D. Kerwin, Kerwin & 

Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023                            n5-19 

     

 

  ESTATE OF PHILIP G. 

GUARNESCHELLI, late of Susquehanna 
Township, Dauphin County, PA (died:  

September 28, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 



 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: N. Timothy Guarneschelli, 5775 

Nesbit Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17112 

 Attorney: Elyse E. Rogers, Esquire, Mette, 

Evans & Woodside, 3401 North Front Street, 

P.O. Box 5950, Harrisburg, PA 17110-0950 

n5-19 

     

 

SECOND PUBLICATION 
 

  ESTATE OF PRESTON ADAMS, JR., late 

of Susquehanna Township, Dauphin County, 

PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Samuel L. Adams 

  Attorney: Melanie Walz Scaringi, Esquire, 

Scaringi Law, 2000 Linglestown Rd., Suite 106 

Harrisburg, PA 17110                              o29-n12 
     

 

  ESTATE OF STACIE COY, late of Dauphin 

County, PA (died: January 9, 2020) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrators or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrators without delay. 

  Administrators: Eric A. Coy, and Dominic 

Montagnese 

  Attorney: 624 North Front Street, 

Wormleysburg, PA 17043                       o29-n12 
     

 

  ESTATE OF MARGARET A. SHADLE, 

late of the Halifax Township, Dauphin County, 

PA (died: September 17, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executors without delay. 

  Co-Executors: Donna P. Tobias, 70 A 

Hoffman Road, Halifax, PA 17032; Donald P. 

Shadle, Jr., 6267 Route 209, Lykens, PA 17048 

  Attorney: Gregory M. Kerwin, Kerwin & 
Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023                         o29-n12 

  ESTATE OF WILLIAM BLAKE a/k/a 

WILLIAM B. BLAKE, JR., late of Derry 

Township, Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Richard R. Blake, c/o George W. 
Porter, Esquire, 909 East Chocolate Avenue, 

Hershey, Pennsylvania 17033                 o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JARED KLINGER, a/k/a 

JARED M. KLINGER, a/k/a JARED 

MATTHEW KLINGER, late of Lower Paxton 

Township, Dauphin County, PA 17112 (died: 
November 18, 2020) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Jeremy J. Klinger, 110 Walnut 

Street, Mifflinburg, PA 17844 

  Attorney: Barbara L. Feudale, Esquire, 419 

McKnight Street, PO Box 25, Gordon PA 17936 

o29-n12 

     

 
  ESTATE OF WILLIAM H. SMITH, late of 

Londonderry Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executors without delay. 

  Co-Executors: Robert Quigley, 1116 

Whitehall Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17010; Judy 

M. Longstreet, 1274 Hodges Avenue, Las 

Vegas, NV 89123 

  Attorney: Kathleen B. Murren, Esq., 

SkarlatosZonarich, LLC, 320 Market Street, 
Suite 600 West, Harrisburg, PA 17101   o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF BARBARA L. ETZWEILER, 

late of Upper Paxton Township, Dauphin 

County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 



 

 Executor: Earl R. Etzweiler, 274 Creek View 

Drive, Millersburg, PA 17061 

  Attorney: Earl Richard Etzweiler, Esquire, 
105 N. Front Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101; 

(717) 234-5600                                        o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JOHN R. GOOD, late of the 

City of Harrisburg, County of Dauphin, PA 

(died: August 7, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Jeffrey A. Good, 5514 Edsel Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17109 
  Attorney: Joseph D. Kerwin, Kerwin & 

Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023                         o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF VICKI F. LEGO, late of 

Dauphin County, PA 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: James Henry Calkins, III, c/o 
William R. Kaufman, Esquire, 940 Century 

Drive, Mechanicsburg, PA 17055-4376   

o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JAMES E. GOOD a/k/a 

JAMES EDWARD GOOD, late of the 
Borough of Lykens, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

September 8, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Apryl L. Evangelesta, 42 Thurston 

Road, Taylors, SC 29687-5975 

  Attorney: Joseph D. Kerwin, Kerwin & 

Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023                         o29-n12 

     

 
  ESTATE OF JOHN E. ACRI, late of Swatara 

Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: April 10, 

2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Amanda Snoke Dubbs, 204 St. 

Charles Way, Suite F, York, PA 17402 

  Attorney: Snoke Dubbs & Buhite Law, Inc., 

204 St. Charles Way, Suite F, York, PA 17402 

o29-n12 

     
 

  ESTATE OF RUTH R. RAKER, late of the 

Township of Upper Paxton, Dauphin County, 

PA (died: February 2, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Co-Executors or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executors without delay. 

  Co-Executors: Carol A. Raker, 467 Miller 

Lane, Mifflinburg, PA 17844; Steven L. Raker, 

445 Middle Road, Halifax, PA 17032 

  Attorney: Joseph D. Kerwin, Kerwin & 
Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023                         o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF RONALD E. BUFFINGTON, 

late of the Township of Jackson, Dauphin 

County, and Commonwealth of PA (died: 

September 15, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 
  Administrator: Brian K. Buffington, 621 

Matamoras Road, Halifax, PA 17032 

  Attorney: Joseph D. Kerwin, Kerwin & 

Kerwin, LLP, 4245 State Route 209, 

Elizabethville, PA 17023                         o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF MARCELLA ODESSA 

WEAVER late of Harrisburg, Dauphin County, 

PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administratrix without delay. 

  Administratrix: Brenda Lackey, 1278P Oyler 

Road, Harrisburg, PA 17104 

  Attorney: Jay P. Lundy, Esquire, LUNDY & 

LUNDY, 219 East Union Street, PO Box 74, 



 

Punxsutawney, PA  15767                       o29-n12 

     

 
  ESTATE OF JUNE M. GALLAGHER, 

a/k/a JUNE MARIE GALLAGHER, late of 

Swatara Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Robert F. Gallagher, c/o Randall K. 

Miller, Esq., 659 E. Willow Street, 

Elizabethtown, PA 17022 

  Attorney: Randall K. Miller                 o29-n12 

     

 
  ESTATE OF KAY S. PRESSLEY a/k/a 

KAY PRESSLEY, late of Dauphin County, PA 

(died: August 15, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Personal Representative or attorney, and all 

persons indebted to the decedent to make 

Personal Representative to the Executor without 

delay. 

  Personal Representative: Joann P. Smith, 

2607 N. 2nd Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110.  

  Attorney: Brandon S. O'Connor, Esquire, 

METTE, EVANS & WOODSIDE, 3401 North 
Front Street, P.O. Box 5950, Harrisburg, PA 

17110-0950                                              o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JEANNE Z. COSTIK, late of 

Conewago Township, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: August 15, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Barbara A. Costik, 4881 Ridge 
Road, Elizabethtown, PA 17022 

  Attorney: Elizabeth H. Feather, Esquire, 

Caldwell & Kearns, P.C., 3631 North Front 

Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110; (717) 901-5948 

o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF CLINTON L. WEAVER, late 
of Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, 

PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executors: Kim E. Lydzinski, 2 Gunpowder 

Road, Mechanicsburg, PA 17050; Kathleen M. 

Carst, 6322 Darlington Drive, Harrisburg, PA 

17112; Scott C. Weaver, Sr., 4139 Wimbledon 

Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17112 

  Attorney: Andrew S. Withers, Esquire, 105 N. 

Front Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101; (717) 234-
5600                                                         o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF SHIRLEY A. HENRY, a/k/a 

SHIRLEY ANN HENRY, late of East Hanover 

Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

September 3, 3021 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Mary Henry, 6780 Linglestown 
Road, Harrisburg, PA 17112 

  Attorney: Marlene Wilson, Esq., Wilson Law, 

1461 Pheasant Hill Rd., Dauphin, PA 17018 

o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF RALPH E. 

DIEFFENDERFER, late of Dauphin County, 
PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Philip L. Zulli, Esq., 155 Grandview 

Road, Hummelstown, PA 17036             o29-n12 

     

 

  ESTATE OF LOIS E. WERT, late of 

Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the personal representatives or attorney, and all 

persons indebted to the decedent to make 

personal representatives to the Executor without 

delay. 

  Personal Representatives: Maureen E. Wert, 
Keith L. Wert, 1055 Mountain Road, 

Elizabethville, Pa 17023 

  Attorney: Jeffrey J. Crossland, Esq., 129 

Market Street, P.O. Box 352, Lewisburg, PA 

17837                                                       o29-n12 



 

  NOTICE OF TRUST ADMINISTRATION 

OF THE EVELYN E. VENARCHIK 

LIVING TRUST dated November 25, 1997, as 
amended (the “Trust”), following the death of 

Evelyn E. Venarchik aka Evelyn Elaine 

Venarchik, late of Lower Paxton Township, 

Dauphin County, PA on August 15, 2021 (the 

“Decedent”), is hereby given. 

  ESTATE OF EVELYN E. VENARCHIK 

a/k/a EVELYN ELAINE VENARCHIK, late 

of Lower Paxton Township, Dauphin County, 
PA (died: August 15, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Successor Death Co-Trustees and Co-

Executors or attorney, and all persons indebted 

to the decedent to make payment to the 
Successor Death Co-Trustees and Co-Executors 

without delay. 

  Successor Death Co-Trustees and Co-

Executors: Adrienne Fach and Lynn Davis, 215 

N. Railroad Street, Hummelstown, PA 17036 

  Attorney: Neil W. Yahn, Esquire, JSDC Law 

Offices, 11 East Chocolate A venue, Suite 300, 
Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280      o29-n12 

     

 

  NOTICE OF TRUST ADMINISTRATION 

OF THE JEAN H. VARGO LIVING TRUST 

dated November 8, 2000, as amended (the 

“Trust”), following the death of Jean H. Vargo 

a/k/a Jean Hadarich Vargo, late of Derry 
Township, Dauphin County, PA on July 28, 

2021 (the “Decedent”), is hereby given. 

  ESTATE OF JEAN H. VARGO a/k/a JEAN 

HADARICH VARGO, late of Derry 

Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: July 28, 

2021) 

  All persons having claims against the 
Decedent, Trust, or Estate are requested to 

present them for settlement and all persons 

indebted to the Decedent, Trust, or Estate are 

requested to make immediate payment to: 

Successor Death Co-Trustees and Co-

Executors: Jeffrey A. Vargo and Julie A. Vargo, 

1204 Ocean Dunes Circle, Jupiter, FL 33477 

  Attorney: Christa M. Aplin, Esquire, JSDC 
Law Offices, 11 East Chocolate Avenue, Suite 

300, Hershey, PA 17033; (717) 533-3280   

o29-n12 

     

 

THIRD PUBLICATION 
 

  ESTATE OF BETTY L. FLICKINGER, 

late of Middletown Borough, Dauphin County, 

PA (died: August 20, 2021) 
  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Sheri L. Charney, 78 Foxfire Lane, 

Lewisberry, PA 17339 

  Attorney: Brian J. Hinkle, Mette, Evans and 

Woodside, 3401 N. Front Street, Harrisburg, PA 

17110; Telephone: (717) 232-5000          o22-n5 

     
 

  ESTATE OF FLORENCE M. SOUDERS, 

late of the Lower Swatara Township, Dauphin 

County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Adam R. Deluca, Esq., P.O. 

Box E, New Cumberland, PA 17070        o22-n5 

     

 
  ESTATE OF TRACY Y. RAMSEY, late of 

the City of Harrisburg, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: July 26, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Ian K. Ramsey, 1815 

Mulberry Street, Harrisburg, PA 17104 

  Attorney:  Ronald L. Finck, Mette, Evans and 

Woodside, 3401 N. Front Street, Harrisburg, PA 

17110; Telephone: (717) 232-5000          o22-n5 
     

 

  ESTATE OF PATRICK P. SMITH, late of 

Penbrook Borough, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator:  William Smith 

  Attorney: Craig A. Diehl, Esquire, CPA, Law 

Offices of Craig A. Diehl, 3464 Trindle Road, 

Camp Hill, PA 17011                               o22-n5 

     
 

  ESTATE OF ROBERT J. TENNANT a/k/a 

ROBERT J. TENNANT JR., late of 

Middletown Borough, Dauphin County, PA 

(died: June 25, 2021) 



 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Tina M. Tennant 

  Attorney:  Aviv S.  Bliwas, 3514 Trindle 

Road, Second Floor, Camp Hill, PA 17011; 717-

761-4864                                                   o22-n5 
     

 

  ESTATE OF BONNIE A. CONNELL, a/k/a 

BONNIE ANN CONNELL, late of 

Londonderry Twp., Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Mary Joyce Fulmer, c/o Attorney 

Randall K. Miller, 659 E. Willow Street, 

Elizabethtown, PA 17022 
  Attorney: Randall K. Miller, Esquire, 659 E. 

Willow Street, Elizabethtown, PA 17022  

o22-n5 

     

 

  ESTATE OF JEFFREY SCOTT 

WAYBRIGHT a/k/a JEFFREY S. 

WAYBRIGHT, late of Susquehanna 
Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Administratrix without delay. 

  Administratrix: Trudy D. Vizzini, 5132 

Sunset Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17112 

  Attorney: Theresa L. Shade-Wix, Esquire, 

Wix, Wenger & Weidner, 4705 Duke Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17109-3041                      o22-n5 

     

 
  ESTATE OF VICTOR LIEFKE a/k/a 

VICTOR LIEFKE, SR., late of Lower Paxton 

Township, Dauphin County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Monika Liefke Hanna, 121 Wayne 

Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17112 

  Attorney: Butler Law Firm, 1007 Mumma 

Road, Suite 101, Lemoyne, PA 17043     o22-n5 

     

 
  ESTATE OF RICHARD A. CAPPELLI, 

late of Derry Township , Dauphin County, PA 

(died: 09/09/201) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administratrix or attorney, and all persons 
indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administratrix without delay. 

  Administratrix:  Sandra B. Cappelli, 1178 W. 

Granada Avenue, Hershey, PA  17033 

  Attorney: Robin J. Marzella, Esquire, R.J. 

Marzella & Associates, 3513 North Front Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17110                               o22-n5 

     
 

  ESTATE OF FRED W. BOWSER, late of 

Derry Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

August 28, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 
against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Michael F. Bowser, 3914 

Rutherford Street, Harrisburg, PA 17111 

  Attorney: Christopher K. Lilik, Esq., DeSantis 

Krupp, 4200 Crums Mill Road, Suite 200 
Harrisburg, PA 17112                               o22-n5 

     

 

  ESTATE OF FRANKLIN T. MITCHELL, 

late of Thompsontown, Juniata County, PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Administrator or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Administrator without delay. 

  Administrator: Orvis E. Rowles, Jr 

  Attorney: Melanie Walz Scaringi, Esquire, 

Scaringi Law, 2000 Linglestown Road, Suite 
106, Harrisburg, PA 17110                       o22-n5 

     

 

  ESTATE OF S. L. NUTTALL, a/k/a 

STARR NUTTALL, late of Lower Swatara 

Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

November 1, 2020) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 
the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 



 

Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Allan Schlusser, 94 Mic Nan Drive, 

Middletown, PA 17057 
  Attorney: Elizabeth H. Feather, Esquire, 

Caldwell & Kearns, P.C., 3631 North Front 

Street, Harrisburg, PA 17110; (717) 901-5948 

                                                                 o22-n5 

     

 

  ESTATE OF ANNETTE AGNES ANTOUN 

a/k/a ANNETTE A. ANTOUN, late of Lower 
Paxton Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: 

June 16, 2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Executor or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 
Executor without delay. 

  Executor: Scott Joseph Antoun 

  Attorney: Vicky Ann Trimmer, Esquire, 

Daley Zucker, LLC, 645 N. 12th Street, Suite 

200, Lemoyne, PA 17043                         o22-n5 

     

 
  ESTATE OF LYSLE MOORE FREW, 

a/k/a LYSLE M. FREW, late of Susquehanna 

Township, Dauphin County, PA (died: July 22, 

2021) 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 

given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 
the Executrix or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Executrix without delay. 

  Executrix: Ms. Janice Frew Walls, 1131 

Colonial Club Drive, Harrisburg, PA 17112 

  Attorney: Gary L. Rothschild, Esq., 2215 

Forest Hills Drive, Suite 35, Harrisburg, PA 
17112                                                        o22-n5 

     

 

  ESTATE OF VELMA P. SCHUCKER, late 

of West Hanover Township, Dauphin County, 

PA 

  The Register of Wills has granted Letters on 

the Estate of the Decedent. Notice is hereby 
given to request all persons having claims 

against the decedent to make known the same to 

the Co-Executrices or attorney, and all persons 

indebted to the decedent to make payment to the 

Co-Executrices without delay. 

  Co-Executrices: Beth A. Roberts and Trudy S. 

Beers 

  Attorney: Kevin M. Dugan, Esquire, Feather 
and Feather, P.C., 22 West Main Street, 

Annville, PA 17003                                  o22-n5 

     

 

 

FIRST PUBLICATION 

 

CORPORATE NOTICES 
 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Tony's 

Fine Foods, Inc., a foreign corporation formed 
under the laws of the State of California its 

principal office is located at 313 Iron Horse 

Way, Providence, RI 02908, has registered to do 

business in Pennsylvania with the Department of 

State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 

Harrisburg, PA, on 9/21/21, under the 

provisions of Chapter 4 of the Association 

Transactions Act. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that, pursuant 

to the Business Corporation Law of 1988, Mark 

One Capital, Inc., a business corporation 

incorporated under the laws of the Delaware, has 

withdrawn from doing business in Pennsylvania. 

The address of its principal office in its 

jurisdiction of incorporation is 23975 Park 

Sorrento, Suite 400, Calabasas, CA 91302 and 

the name of its commercial registered office 

provider in Pennsylvania is C T Corporation 
System. The statement of Withdrawal of 

Foreign Registration shall take effect upon filing 

in the Department of State. This was filed with 

the PA Department of State on 10/7/21.              n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 

the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 
415 or 417, Custom Vault Corporation, a 

corporation incorporated under the laws of the 

State of Connecticut with its registered office in 

PA at c/o: Corporation Service Co., Dauphin 

County, intends to file a Statement of 

Withdrawal of Foreign Registration with the 

Dept. of State.                                                                  n5 
     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN ReUp 

Education, Inc., a foreign business corporation 

incorporated under the laws of Delaware, with 

its princ. office located at 9901 Brodie Ln., Ste. 

160, #229, Austin, TX 78748, has applied for a 

Statement of Registration to do business in 
Pennsylvania under the provisions of Chapter 4 

of the Association Transactions Act. The 

commercial registered office provider in PA is 

c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     
 



 

  Notice is hereby given that Creative Foam 

Corporation DBA CFC Enterprises, Inc., a 

foreign corporation formed under the laws of the 
State of Michigan its principal office is located 

at 300 N. Alloy Dr., Fenton, MI 48430, has 

registered to do business in Pennsylvania with 

the Department of State of the Commonwealth 

of Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA, on 10/27/21, 

under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 

Association Transactions Act. 

  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 
deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 

Registration Statement has been filed with the 

Department of State of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 
October 20, 2021, for a foreign corporation with 

a registered address in the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania as follows: CompanyCam, Inc. 

c/o Capitol Corporate Services, Inc. 

  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 

of Delaware. 

  The address of its principal office is 300 
Canopy St., Ste. 200, Lincoln, NE 68508. 

  The corporation has been qualified in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 

Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 

n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 
Registration Statement has been filed with the 

Department of State of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 

October 19, 2021, for a foreign corporation with 

a registered address in the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania as follows: Human Health of 

Nebraska, P.C. c/o Capitol Corporate Services, 
Inc. 

  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 

of Nebraska. 

  The address of its principal office is 2269 

Chestnut Street #523, San Francisco, CA 94123. 

  The corporation has been qualified in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 

Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 
n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 

Registration Statement has been filed with the 

Department of State of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 

October 19, 2021, for a foreign corporation with 
a registered address in the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania as follows: FOCUS CARE 

SOLUTIONS, INC. c/o Registered Agent 

Solutions, Inc. 

  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 

of Massachusetts. 

  The address of its principal office is 500 West 

Cummings Park, Suite 2700, Woburn, MA 
01801. 

  The corporation has been qualified in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 

Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 

n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 
Registration Statement has been filed with the 

Department of State of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 

October 21, 2021, for a foreign corporation with 

a registered address in the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania as follows: Valar Labs, Inc. c/o 

National Registered Agents, Inc. 

  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 
of Delaware. 

  The address of its principal office is 855 El 

Camino Real, Ste. 13A-292, Palo Alto, CA 

94301. 

  The corporation has been qualified in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 

Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 
n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a Foreign 

Registration Statement has been filed with the 

Department of State of the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania, at Harrisburg, PA on or about 

October 20, 2021, for a foreign corporation with 
a registered address in the Commonwealth of 

Pennsylvania as follows: WISETECH 

GLOBAL (US) INC. c/o Capitol Corporate 

Services, Inc. 

  This corporation is incorporated under the laws 

of Illinois. 

  The address of its principal office is 1051 E. 
Woodfield Rd., Schaumburg, IL 60173. 

  The corporation has been qualified in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of the 

Business Corporation Law of 1988, as amended. 

n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Parse 

Biosciences, Inc., a foreign business 

corporation incorporated under the laws of 

Delaware, with its princ. office located at 201 

Elliot Ave. W, Ste. 290, Seattle, WA 98119, has 

applied for a Statement of Registration to do 

business in Pennsylvania under the provisions of 

Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions Act. 

The commercial registered office provider in PA 
is c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     

 



 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Promise 

Network Inc., a foreign business corporation 

incorporated under the laws of Delaware, with 
its princ. office located at 436 14th St., Ste. 920, 

Oakland, CA 94612, has applied for a Statement 

of Registration to do business in Pennsylvania 

under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 

Association Transactions Act. The commercial 

registered office provider in PA is c/o: 

Corporation Service Co., and shall be deemed 

for venue and official publication purposes to be 
located in Dauphin County.                                       n5 

     

  

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 

the applicable provisions of 15 Pa.C.S. Section 

415 or 417, Southern Home Care Services, 

Inc., a corporation incorporated under the laws 

of the State of Delaware with its registered 
office in PA at c/o: Corporation Service Co., 

Dauphin County, intends to file a Statement of 

Withdrawal of Foreign Registration with the 

Dept. of State.                                                                  n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN FCC 

CONSTRUCTION, INC., a foreign business 

corporation incorporated under the laws of 

Florida, with its princ. office located at 1101 

Brickell Ave., Ste. 1601, Miami, FL 33131, has 

applied for a Statement of Registration to do 

business in Pennsylvania under the provisions of 

Chapter 4 of the Association Transactions Act. 

The commercial registered office provider in PA 
is c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Michels 

Trenchless, Inc., a foreign corporation formed 
under the laws of the State of Delaware its 

principal office is located at 817 Main St., 

Brownsville, WI 53006, has registered to do 

business in Pennsylvania with the Department of 

State of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 

Harrisburg, PA, on 10/14/21, under the 

provisions of Chapter 4 of the Association 

Transactions Act. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Camp 

Pinecliffe, DBA Camp Pinecliffe, Inc, a 

foreign corporation formed under the laws of the 
State of Maine, and its principal office is located 

at 277 South Cassingham Rd., Columbus, OH 

43209, has registered to do business in 

Pennsylvania with the Department of State of 

the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, at 

Harrisburg, PA, on 10/12/21, under the 

provisions of Chapter 4 of the Association 

Transactions Act. 
  The registered office in Pennsylvania shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN to all creditors 

and claimants of CHESTER PROCESSING 

SERVICES, INC., a Pennsylvania (PA) 
corporation, which on 2/13/2008, was 

incorporated in the Commonwealth of PA, that 

said company intends to file Articles of 

Dissolution with the Dept. of State under the 

provisions of PA Business Corporation Law. 

The name of its commercial reg'd office 

provider and the county of venue is c/o: 

Corporation Service Co., Dauphin County.       n5 
     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Ember 

Recreational Vehicles, Inc., a foreign business 

corporation incorporated under the laws of 

Indiana, with its princ. office located at 1728 

Commerce Dr., Bristol, IN 46507, has applied 
for a Statement of Registration to do business in 

Pennsylvania under the provisions of Chapter 4 

of the Association Transactions Act. The 

commercial registered office provider in PA is 

c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5  

     
 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Fetch 

Rewards, Inc., a foreign business corporation 

incorporated under the laws of Delaware, with 

its princ. office located at 3902 Milwaukee St., 

#7068, Madison, WI 53707, has applied for a 

Statement of Registration to do business in 
Pennsylvania under the provisions of Chapter 4 

of the Association Transactions Act. The 

commercial registered office provider in PA is 

c/o: Corporation Service Co., and shall be 

deemed for venue and official publication 

purposes to be located in Dauphin County.       n5 

     

 
  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN Soundview 

Claims Solutions Inc., a foreign business 

corporation incorporated under the laws of 

Delaware, with its princ. office located at 

Harborside 3, 210 Hudson St., Ste. 300, Jersey 

City, NJ 07311, has applied for a Statement of 

Registration to do business in Pennsylvania 

under the provisions of Chapter 4 of the 
Association Transactions Act. The commercial 

registered office provider in PA is c/o: 

Corporation Service Co., and shall be deemed 

for venue and official publication purposes to be 

located in Dauphin County.                                       n5 



 

FICTITIOUS NAME 

NOTICES 

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that pursuant to 

the Fictitious Names Act of December 16, 1982, 
Act No. 295, 54 Pa. C.S. § 301 et seq., as 

amended, an Application for Registration of 

Fictitious Name for Homeland Palliative Care 

for conduct of business in Dauphin County, 

Pennsylvania, with the principal place of 

business being 1901 N. Fifth Street, Harrisburg, 

PA 17102, was filed with the Pennsylvania 

Department of State in Harrisburg, 
Pennsylvania, on October 7, 2021. 

  The name and address of the entity owning or 

interested in the business is: Home for the 

Friendless d/b/a Homeland Center, 1901 N. 

Fifth Street, Harrisburg, PA 17102. 

 

Bradford Dorrance, Esquire 
KEEFER WOOD ALLEN & RAHAL, LLP 

417 Walnut Street, 3rd Floor, Rear 

P. O. Box 11963 

n5                           Harrisburg, PA  17108-1963 

     

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN an application 

for registration of the fictitious name Tedrow 

Design Group, P.C. 2866 Adams Brook Way, 

Snellville, GA 30078 has been filed in the 

Department of State at Harrisburg, PA, File Date 

09/15/2021 pursuant to the Fictitious Names 

Act, Act 1982-295. The name and address of the 

person who is a party to the registration is 

Thomas Tedrow, 2866 Adams Brook Way, 

Snellville, PA 30078.                                                   n5 
     

 

MISCELLENOUS 

NOTICES 

 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

DAUPHIN COUNTY,  

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

NO. 2021-CV-03260-MF 

 

CIVIL ACTION-LAW 

 

NOTICE OF ACTION  

IN MORTGAGE FORECLOSURE 

 

FIFTH THIRD BANK, NATIONAL 

ASSOCIATION, PLAINTIFF 

VS. 

JASON A. LONGREEN; TINA MARIE 

LONGREEN, DEFENDANTS 

 

To: TINA MARIE LONGREEN Defendant(s), 

201 VILLAGE RD. HARRISBURG, PA 17112; 

30 NORTH ORANGE STREET, CARLISLE, 

PA 17013 
     

COMPLAINT IN  

MORTGAGE FORECLOSURE 

 

  YOU ARE HEREBY NOTIFIED that 

Plaintiff, FIFTH THIRD BANK, NATIONAL 

ASSOCIATION, has filed a Mortgage 

Foreclosure Complaint endorsed with a Notice 
to Defend, against you in the Court of Common 

Pleas of DAUPHIN County, PA docketed to No. 

2021-CV-03260-MF, seeking to foreclose the 

mortgage secured on your property located, 201 

VILLAGE RD. HARRISBURG, PA 17112. 

 

NOTICE 

 
  YOU HAVE BEEN SUED IN COURT. If you 

wish to defend against the claims set forth in this 

notice you must take action within twenty (20) 

days after the Complaint and Notice are served, 

by entering a written appearance personally or 

by attorney and filing in writing with the Court 

your defenses or objections to the claims set 
forth against you. You are warned that if you fail 

to do so, the case may proceed without you, and 

a judgment may be entered against you by the 

Court without further notice for any money 

claimed in the Complaint or for any other claim 

or relief requested by the plaintiff. You may lose 

money or property or other rights important to 

you. 
  YOU SHOULD TAKE THIS PAPER TO 

YOUR LAWYER AT ONCE. IF YOU DO 

NOT HAVE A LAWYER, GO TO OR 

TELEPHONE THE OFFICE SET FORTH 

BELOW. THIS OFFICE CAN PROVIDE YOU 

WITH INFORMATION ABOUT HIRING A 

LAWYER. 
  IF YOU CANNOT AFFORD TO HIRE A 

LAWYER, THIS OFFICE MAY BE ABLE TO 

PROVIDE YOU WITH THE INFORMATION 

ABOUT AGENCIES THAT MAY OFFER 

LEGAL SERVICES TO ELIGIBLE PERSONS 

AT A REDUCED FEE OR NO FEE. 

 

Dauphin County Lawyer Referral Service 
213 North Front Street 

Harrisburg, PA 17101 

717-232-7536 

 

Robertson, Anschutz, Schneid,  

Crane & Partners, PLLC 

ATTORNEYS FOR PLAINTIFF 

Jenine Davey, Esq. ID No. 87077 
133 Gaither Drive, Suite F 

Mt. Laurel, NJ 08054 

n5                                                  855-225-6906 

     

 



 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF DAUPHIN COUNTY, 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

NO: 2021-CV-6331-DV 

 

CIVIL ACTION – LAW 

 

JUAN-MARTIN TOLENTINO DELA-

CRUZ, PLAINTIFF  

VS. 

ELIZABETH NIEVES a/k/a ELIZABTH 

TOLENTINO, DEFENDANT  

 

To: ELIZABETH NIEVES AKA ELIZABTH 

TOLENTINO 

 

  PLEASE BE ADVISED that Juan-Martin 

Tolentino Dela-Cruz has filed an action in 
Divorce against you.  

 

NOTICE 

 

  YOU HAVE BEEN SUED in court. If you 

wish to defend you must take prompt action. 

You are warned that if you fail to do so, the case 
may proceed without you and a decree of 

divorce or annulment may be entered against 

you by the court. A judgment may also be 

entered against you for any other claim or relief 

requested by the plaintiff. You may lose money 

or property or other rights important to you, 

including custody of your children. 

  WHEN THE ground for the divorce is 
indignities or irretrievable breakdown of the 

marriage, you may request marriage counseling. 

A list of marriage counselors is available in the 

office of the Prothonotary on the first floor of the 

Dauphin County Courthouse, 101 Market Street, 

Harrisburg, Dauphin County, PA 17101.  

  YOU SHOULD TAKE THIS PAPER TO 
YOUR LAWYER AT ONCE. IF YOU DO 

NOT HAVE A LAWYER, GO TO OR 

TELEPHONE THE OFFICE SET FORTH 

BELOW. THIS OFFICE CAN PROVIDE YOU 

WITH INFORMA TION ABOUT HIRING A 

LAWYER.  

  IF YOU CANNOT AFFORD TO HIRE A 

LAWYER, THIS OFFICE MAY BE ABLE TO 
PROVIDE YOU WITH INFORMATION 

ABOUT AGENCIES THAT MAY OFFER 

LEGAL SERVICES TO ELIGIBLE PERSONS 

AT A REDUCED FEE OR NO FEE.  

 

DAUPHIN COUNTY BAR ASSOCIATION 

LAWYER REFERRAL SERVICE 

213 NORTH FRONT STREET, 
HARRISBURG, PA 17101 

717-232-7536n 

n5 

     

 

SECOND PUBLICATION 

 

MISCELLENOUS 

NOTICES 

 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF LANCASTER COUNTY, 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

TERM NO. 2878 OF 2021 

 

ORPHANS’ COURT DIVISION 

 

IN RE: JAZELYNN GRUNKE 

 
NOTICE 

 

TO: Unknown Father   

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the 

Lancaster County Children & Youth Social 

Service Agency has presented to Orphans’ Court 
Division, Court of Common Pleas of Lancaster 

County, PA, a Petition for termination of any 

rights you have or might have concerning the 

child known as Jazelynn Grunke, born on May 

25, 2020.  The Court has set a hearing to 

consider ending your rights to your child.  That 

hearing will be held in Courtroom No. 1 of the 

Lancaster County Courthouse, 50 North Duke 
Street, Lancaster, PA, on November 30, 2021, 

at 9:00 a.m. prevailing time. You are warned 

that even if you fail to appear at the scheduled 

hearing, the hearing will go on without you and 

your rights to your child may be ended by the 

court without your being present. You have a 

right to be represented at the hearing by a 

lawyer.  
  YOU SHOULD TAKE THIS PAPER TO 

YOUR LAWYER AT ONCE.  IF YOU DO 

NOT HAVE A LAWYER OR CANNOT 

AFFORD ONE, GO TO OR TELEPHONE 

THE OFFICE SET FORTH BELOW TO FIND 

OUT WHERE YOU CAN GET LEGAL HELP. 

 
Lancaster Bar Association 

Lawyer Referral Service 

28 East Orange Street 

Lancaster, PA 17602 

717-393-0737 

 

NOTICE REQUIRED BY ACT 101 OF 

2010 - 23 Pa. C.S. §§2731-2742 

 

  YOU ARE HEREBY informed of an important 

option that may be available to you under 

Pennsylvania law. Act 101 of 2010 allows for an 

enforceable voluntary agreement for continuing 

contact with your child following an adoption.  

 



 

LANCASTER COUNTY CHILDREN & 

YOUTH SOCIAL SERVICE AGENCY 

150 NORTH QUEEN STREET 
LANCASTER, PA  17603 

o29-n5                                        (717) 299-7925 

     

 

FIRST PUBLICATION 

 

NAME CHANGE 

NOTICES 

 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF DAUPHIN COUNTY 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

DOCKET NO: 2021-CV-08491-NC 

 

PETITION FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

 

NOTICE 

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on 
September 30, 2021, the Petition of Yashneil 

Singh Bibra was filed in the above named court, 

requesting a decree to change his name from 

Yashneil Singh Bibra to Yashneil Singh. 

  The Court has fixed Wednesday, December 15, 

2021, at 9:00 a.m., in Courtroom No. 8, Fifth 

Floor, Dauphin County Courthouse, 101 Market 

Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101 as the time and 
place for the hearing on said Petition, when and 

where all persons interested may appear and 

show cause if any they have, why the prayer of 

the said Petition should not be granted. 

 

Attorney: Robert C. May, Esq. 

May & May, P.C. 
4330 Carlisle Pike 

n5                                    Camp Hill, PA  17011 

     

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS 

OF DAUPHIN COUNTY 

PENNSYLVANIA 

 

DOCKET NO: 2021-CV-08335-NC 

 

PETITION FOR CHANGE OF NAME 

 

NOTICE 

 

  NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on 
September 28, 2021 the Petition of Trelonni 

Javon Elliott was filed in the above named court, 

requesting a decree to change his name from 
Trelonni Javon Elliott to Trelonni Javon 

Peterson.  

  The Court has fixed Wednesday, December 15, 

2021, at 9:00 a.m., in Courtroom No. 8, Fifth 

Floor, Dauphin County Courthouse, 101 Market 
Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101 as the time and 

place for the hearing on said Petition, when and 

where all persons interested may appear and 

show cause if any they have, why the prayer of 

the said Petition should not be granted.               n5
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Board of Directors 

  
Officers 

  

Paula J. McDermott 

President 

 
 Scott B. Cooper 

President-Elect 

 

Kimberly A. Selemba 

Vice-President 

 

Tracey S. Lewis 

Secretary 
 

Thomas P. Gacki 

Treasurer 

 

Lisa M. Benzie 

Past President 

 

Fawn E. Kehler 

Young Lawyers’ Chair 

 

Anthony J. Gabriel 
Young Lawyers’ Chair Elect 

 

Directors 

 

William L. Adler 
Carolyn M. Anner 

Nicole R. Antos 

LaToya Winfield Bellamy 

Michael R. Dimino 

Michael T. Foerster 

Dennis R. Kergick, Jr. 

Jonathan D. Koltash 

Matthew R. Krupp 
Jonathan W. Kunkel 

Teresa C. Marino 

Mark J. Powell 

Hon. Lori K. Serratelli 

Leonard Tintner 

Tracy L. Updike

         
 

The Board of Directors of the Bar Association meets on the third Thursday of the month at the Bar 

Association headquarters. Anyone wishing to attend or have matters brought before the Board should contact 

the Bar Association office in advance. 

 
  

 

REPORTING OF ERRORS IN ADVANCE SHEET 

 

  The Bench and Bar will contribute to the accuracy in matters of detail of the permanent edition of the 

Dauphin County Reporter by sending to the editor promptly, notice of all errors appearing in this advance 

sheet. Inasmuch as corrections are made on a continuous basis, there can be no assurance that corrections can 

be made later than thirty (30) days from the date of this issue but this should not discourage the submission 
of notice of errors after thirty (30) days since they will be handled in some way if at all possible. Please send 

such notice of errors to: Dauphin County Reporter, Dauphin County Bar Association, 213 North Front Street, 

Harrisburg, PA 17101-1493. 

 

DAUPHIN COUNTY COURT SECTION 

Opinions Not Yet Reported 

 
October 12, 2021 – Dowling. J., Turnpaugh v. Erie Insurance, Dau. Co. No. 2019-CV-06937-CV  

http://www.dcba-pa.org/
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PART TIME ATTORNEY: Immediate opening for part time attorney to do legal research for a small civil 
litigation firm.   Please send resume to Angino Law Firm, 1800 Linglestown Road, Suite 301, Harrisburg, 

PA 17110                                                                                                                                                 o29-n12 
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